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Dear Team Editorial,

 

I am Hendra Cipta (Mr.), an academician from Surabaya Indonesia. I would like to submit a research paper for publishing in International Journal of Economics, Business and
Management Research. Previously I had submitted it to the system.

 

Please notify me once the paper submitted is received and being processed for the publication.

 

Thank you very much.
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To: info@ijebmr.com
Cc: Hendra Cipta <hendraciptaheci@gmail.com>, Zaragani zulfi <zulfiqararagani11@gmail.com>

Dear Editor of IJEBMR 

Kindly confirm this payment on behalf of our corresponding author Hendra Cipta for the forthcoming publication of Paper ID: EBMR0889.
Please acknowledge receipt of this email and we are looking forward to having the specific publication date of our paper.

Thank you very much. 

Best regards,
Evi Thelia Sari

Wer den Kern essen will, muss die Nuss knacken.
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Dear, Author

Thank you for send copyright and payment confirmation your article will be published soon in July issue, we will also inform you after successful publication.

With Regards

Editorial Assistant

IJEBMR

(International Journal of Economics, Business and Management Research)
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From: Editor IJEBMR <info@ijebmr.com>
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Subject: Paper Acceptance letter (Paper ID: EBMR0889) (MAXIMUM PROFIT ANALYSIS OF JATIROSO CATERING SERVICE SIDOARJO)

To: Hendra Cipta <hendraciptaheci@gmail.com>


Dear Author’s

Hendra Cipta, Zulfiqar Aragani and Evi Thelia Sari, SE,. MA

Congratulations! The Editorial Team of International Journal of Economics, Business and Management Research (IJEBMR), is pleased to inform you that your manuscript.
“MAXIMUM PROFIT ANALYSIS OF JATIROSO CATERING SERVICE SIDOARJO” has been accepted for the publication.

Please find attachment for Acceptance Letter and copyright form and pay publication fee 80 USD through Paypal using debit or credit card by this link: ( http://ijebmr.com/
modeofpayment ) (send scan copy of copyright form along with fee receipt) and complete all formality as soon as possible so that we can proceed with the publication.

With Regards

Editorial Assistant

IJEBMR

(International Journal of Economics, Business and Management Research)
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---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Editor IJEBMR <info@ijebmr.com>

Date: Thu, Jul 2, 2020, 19:25

Subject: Re: Paper Acceptance letter (Paper ID: EBMR0889) (MAXIMUM PROFIT ANALYSIS OF JATIROSO CATERING SERVICE SIDOARJO)

To: Hendra Cipta <hendraciptaheci@gmail.com>


Dear Author,

Your paper with title " MAXIMUM PROFIT ANALYSIS OF JATIROSO CATERING SERVICE SIDOARJO " has been successfully published in current issue Volume 4, issue
7, 2020

Archive issue : http://ijebmr.com/archive

Published Issue Link : http://ijebmr.com/view/7/2020
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Subject: Re: Paper Acceptance letter (Paper ID: EBMR0889) (MAXIMUM PROFIT ANALYSIS OF JATIROSO CATERING SERVICE SIDOARJO)

To: Hendra Cipta <hendraciptaheci@gmail.com>


Dear Author's

Please find attach cover page, back page and certificates for the author. 
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